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VOBAN          60 24/1# VOBAN VOMIT ACS             ABSORBENTS $99.90 $5,994.00 58.58 3514.8 69.98 4198.8 $49.05 $2,943.00
32COM          12 EA/COMBO 32 OZ BOTTEA             BOTTLES/TRIGGER $4.05 $48.60 1.45 17.4 0.81 9.72 $1.10 $13.20
902RW9         423 EA/TRIGGER 9.75" RED/EA             BOTTLES/TRIGGER $2.70 $1,142.10 0.74 313.02 0.44 186.12 $0.49 $207.27
932CG          168 100/BOTTLE 32 OZ SPR  EA             ED W/DILUTION RATBOTTLES/TRIGGER $2.70 $453.60 0.91 152.88 0.49 82.32 $0.42 $70.56
953            15 EA/TANK SPRAYER 2.25 EA             DISCO BY CONTINENBOTTLES/TRIGGER $74.25 $1,113.75 47.11 706.65 22.98 344.7 $79.85 $1,197.75
362019414      10 EA/HANDLE 48" THREA  EA             PLASTIC TIP BLUE .62  BROOMS/HANDLE $6.75 $67.50 21.98 219.8 $3.15 $31.50
365119         32 EA/SCRAPER 4' METAL EA             BROOMS/HANDLE $22.95 $734.40 21.96 702.72 9.89 316.48 $12.50 $400.00
368100         171 EA/BROOM 34" CORN TEA             BROOMS/HANDLE $10.80 $1,846.80 5.03 860.13 2.71 463.41 $3.12 $533.52
4026100        6 EA/HANDLE 54" TAPER  EA             DIAMETER BROOMS/HANDLE $6.75 $40.50 3.84 23.04 3.39 20.34 $2.92 $17.52
45267          10 EA/HANDLE 60" THREA   EA             .9375  DIAMETER BROOMS/HANDLE $6.75 $67.50 3.99 39.9 3.59 35.9 $2.92 $29.20
97CB           199 EA/BROOM 55" CORN HEA             BROOMS/HANDLE $9.45 $1,880.55 8.93 1777.07 5.98 1190.02 $4.98 $991.02
362195803      20 EA/BRUSH 8" COUNTER EA             BRUSHES $9.45 $189.00 3.81 76.2 2.99 59.8 $2.42 $48.40
36238          780 100/MOP BOWL WHITE EA             BRUSHES $1.35 $1,053.00 1.21 943.8 0.59 460.2 $0.69 $538.20
3628900        20 EA/BRUSH HAND 6X2.5  EA             TRIM 1" -6"LONG BRUSHES $4.05 $81.00 3.48 69.4 0.98 19.6 $1.45 $29.00
40204          12 4/1 CARPET EXTRACTIOGL             CLEANER FIBERPRO P  CARPET CARE $40.50 $486.00 11.22 134.64 $12.06 $144.72
13005          12 6/1 SIMPLE GREEN ALL CS             CONCENTRATE CLEANER ALL PUR $72.90 $874.80 74.98 899.76 $57.10 $685.20
68241          2 6/1000ML SANITIZER F  CS             NON-ALCOHOL FOAM  CLEANER HAND $136.35 $272.70 108.94 217.88 $39.36 $78.72
68941          12 6/1000ML. ANTIBAC. FO  CS             CLEANER HAND $68.85 $826.20 54.16 649.92 $35.98 $431.76
69041          1900 6/1000ML SOAP FOAM  CS             GREENSEAL CERTIFIECLEANER HAND $59.40 $112,860.00 58.28 110732 $34.05 $64,695.00
F4HB           12 12/BLOCK TOILET 4 OZ BX             DEOD. BLOCK/SCR $55.35 $664.20 15.24 182.88 6.89 82.68 $7.35 $88.20
04117          12 2/1GAL AJAX DISINFECT CS             SANITIZER CONCENTDISINFECT/SANITI $67.50 $810.00 63.4 760.8 $23.05 $276.60
34047          12 4/2L QUAT-STAT SC DISCS             MAKES 544 RTU GAL  DISINFECT/SANITI $170.10 $2,041.20 116.09 1393.08 $21.05 $252.60
9950ZPL        12 EA/DISPENSER SOAP LIQ  EA             BAG-N-BOX KUTOL DISP. SOAP $9.45 $113.40 5.2 62.4 $0.00 $0.00
RT22           12 CHROME TOILET TISSU  EA             DISP. TOILET TIS $40.50 $486.00 14.05 168.6 5.98 71.76 $1.20 $14.40
3105           12 EA/DUSTER 26-42" LAM  EA             TELESCOPIC DUSTING TOOLS $12.15 $145.80 8.11 97.32 5.85 70.2 $5.05 $60.60
4062           12 30/TISSUE FACIAL 2 PLY CS             100 SHEET ECONOMFACIAL TISSUE $32.40 $388.80 18.23 218.76 18.98 227.76 $15.05 $180.60
4STAYFREE      50 250/CLASSIC MAXI#4ST  CS             FOLDED FEM. HYGIENE PR $54.00 $2,700.00 NO BID NO BID 30.99 1549.5 $28.10 $1,405.00
PLAYTEX        15 500/TAMPON GENTLE GCS             ODOR ABSORBING FEM. HYGIENE PR $108.00 $1,620.00 NO BID NO BID 62.95 944.25 $55.10 $826.50
17847          12 4/2L PH7 ULTRA NEUTR  CS             MAKES 544 RTU GAL  FLOOR CLEANER $121.50 $1,458.00 NO BID NO BID $74.10 $889.20
61005          1100 5 GAL FLOOR FINISH HI PL             PREMIUM HIGH SPE   FLOOR FINISH $159.30 $175,230.00 75 82500 $68.01 $74,811.00
1410           90 EA/DUSTPAN LOBBY 30   EA             HANDLE FLOOR MISC. $16.20 $1,458.00 12.62 1135.8 6.98 628.2 $8.09 $728.10
2557           60 10/BLADE REPLACEMEN  PK             FITS 2556/2562/256  FLOOR MISC. $16.20 $972.00 27.79 1667.4 5.98 358.8 $30.00 $300.00
2562           40 EA/SCRAPER 48" W/ALU  EA             REPLACEMENT BLAD  FLOOR MISC. $24.30 $972.00 64.01 2560.4 9.89 395.6 $16.66 $666.40
36512000       12 10/BLADE REPLACEMEN  PK             FLOOR MISC. $8.10 $97.20 27.79 333.48 5.98 71.76 $30.00 $60.00
13GREEN        36 5/PAD 13" FLOOR GREE  CS             F/HVY DUTY SCRUB O   FLOOR PADS $24.30 $874.80 10.48 377.28 8.39 302.04 $6.50 $234.00
13RED          10 5/PAD 13" FLOOR RED CS             F/HI GLOSS SPRY BU    FLOOR PADS $24.30 $243.00 10.48 377.28 8.39 83.9 $6.50 $65.00
13WHITE        10 5/PAD 13" FLOOR WHIT  CS             SPRAY BUFF / CLEANFLOOR PADS $10.80 $108.00 10.48 377.28 8.39 83.9 $6.50 $65.00
19BLACK        210 5/PAD 19" FLOOR BLAC  CS             F/HEAVY DUTY WET FLOOR PADS $43.20 $9,072.00 18.58 3901.8 12.15 2551.5 $11.68 $2,452.80
19GREEN        110 5/PAD 19" FLOOR GREE  CS             FLOOR PADS $18.90 $2,079.00 18.94 2083.4 12.15 1336.5 $11.68 $1,284.80
19NFB          53 5/PAD 19" FLOOR NATU   CS             UHS BURNISH FLOOR PADS $45.90 $2,432.70 20.16 1068.48 12.15 643.95 $11.68 $619.04
19RED          30 5/PAD 19" FLOOR RED CS             F/HI GLOSS SPRY BU    FLOOR PADS $18.90 $567.00 18.94 568.2 12.15 364.5 $11.68 $350.40
19WHITE        35 5/PAD 19" FLOOR WHIT  CS             SPRAY BUFF FLOOR PADS $36.45 $1,275.75 18.58 650.3 12.15 425.25 $11.68 $408.80
61805          245 5 GAL HIGH SPEED RESTPL             ONE STEP CLEANER/  FLOOR RESTORER $63.45 $15,545.25 108.95 26692.75 $71.25 $17,456.25
15405          104 5 GAL STRIPPER AX-IT PPL             FAST ACTING PH 13. FLOOR STRIPPER $108.00 $11,232.00 83.07 8639.28 $54.05 $5,621.20
20991          12 10/100 GLOVE NITRILE  CS             BLUE POWDER FREE GLOVES EXAM $58.05 $696.60 48 576 37.9 454.8 $75.62 $453.72
20992          6 10/100 GLOVE NITRILE  CS             BLUE POWDER FREE GLOVES EXAM $58.05 $348.30 48 288 37.9 227.4 $75.62 $226.86
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20993          2 10/100 GLOVE NITRILE  CS             BLUE POWDER FREE GLOVES EXAM $58.05 $116.10 48 96 37.9 75.8 $75.62 $75.62
20994          12 10/100 GLOVE NITRILE  CS             BLUE POWDER FREE GLOVES EXAM $58.05 $696.60 48 576 37.9 454.8 $75.62 $453.72
LF001          216 10/100 GLOVE LATEX P  BX             3.8 MIL GLOVES LATEX P/F $40.50 $8,748.00 3.7 799.2 5.29 1142.64 $3.65 $788.40
LF002          787 10/100 GLOVE LATEX P  BX             3.8 MIL GLOVES LATEX P/F $40.50 $31,873.50 3.7 2911.9 5.29 4163.23 $3.65 $2,872.55
LF003          745 10/100 GLOVE LATEX P  BX             3.8 MIL GLOVES LATEX P/F $40.50 $30,172.50 3.7 2756.5 5.29 3941.05 $3.65 $2,719.25
LF004          333 10/100 GLOVE LATEX P  BX             3.8 MIL GLOVES LATEX P/F $40.50 $13,486.50 3.7 1232.1 5.29 1761.57 $3.65 $1,215.45
50055L         100 12/GLOVE FLOCK YELLO    PR             GLOVES LATEX PD $9.45 $945.00 1.18 118 0.49 49 $0.75 $75.00
50055M         150 12/GLOVE FLOCK YELLO    PR             GLOVES LATEX PD $9.45 $1,417.50 1.18 177 0.49 73.5 $0.75 $112.50
50055XL        130 12/GLOVE FLOCK YELLO    PR             GLOVES LATEX PD $9.45 $1,228.50 1.18 153.4 0.49 63.7 $0.75 $97.50
VF003          12 10/100 GLOVE VINYL P/  BX             POWDER FREE GLOV   GLOVES VINYL $32.40 $388.80 2.81 33.72 3.39 40.68 $1.90 $22.80
201            12 48/SPONGE 1.75X3X5 YBX             HAND PAD/SPONG $29.70 $356.40 15 180 33.12 397.44 $6.05 $72.60
202            10 36/SPONGE 2X4X5.5 YECS             HAND PAD/SPONG $72.90 $729.00 35.7 357 25.56 255.6 $6.05 $60.50
SS20ICE        300 20LB/ICE MELT MAGNE  BG             SAFE STEP ICE MELT $22.95 $6,885.00 NO BID NO BID $5.75 $1,725.00
SS50ICE        12 50LB/ SCOTWOOD TRA BG             POTASSIUM CHLORI ICE MELT $33.75 $405.00 NO BID NO BID $18.36 $220.32
3200PK         140 EA/KNIFE PUTTY 1/4" BEA             JANITOR MISC. $2.70 $378.00 2.3 322 1.29 180.6 $4.25 $595.00
7322           30 PROTECTIVE GOGGLES  EA             JANITOR MISC. $2.70 $81.00 1.06 31.8 1.75 52.5 $2.95 $88.50
7379LG         12 BACK SUPPORT LIFTING  EA             JANITOR MISC. $6.75 $81.00 11.38 136.56 6.89 82.68 $7.50 $90.00
7379MD         12 BACK SUPPORT LIFTING  EA             JANITOR MISC. $6.75 $81.00 11.38 136.56 6.89 82.68 $7.50 $90.00
7379S          12 BACK SUPPORT LIFTING  EA             JANITOR MISC. $6.75 $81.00 12.79 153.48 6.89 82.68 $7.50 $90.00
7389LX         12 BACK SUPPORT LIFTING  EA             JANITOR MISC. $8.10 $97.20 11.47 137.64 6.89 82.68 $7.50 $90.00
JC1945S23      10 EA/GREY JANITOR CART EA             45X19X39 SHORT PL JANITOR MISC. $175.50 $1,755.00 132.07 1320.7 92.98 929.8 $95.00 $950.00
RS810          25 20/50 DUST MASK WHIBX             GENERAL USE JANITOR MISC. $13.50 $337.50 2.25 56.25 4.89 122.25 $6.10 $152.50
2101527        4 156/1.4 OZ TIDE ULTRA  CS             DETERGENT 1 LOAD LAUNDRY DETERG $94.50 $378.00 68.8 275.2 $26.05 $104.20
15519          12 6/36 OZ CLOROX SOFT CS             WITH BLEACH LAUNDRY PRODU $49.95 $599.40 35.54 426.48 $20.05 $240.60
30828          70 9/32 CLOROX H202 CLNCS             HEALTHCARE FASTES   LAUNDRY PRODU $87.75 $6,142.50 87.8 6146 $59.10 $4,137.00
A1             12 6/1 BLEACH GALLON 5. CS             SODIUM HYDROCHL LAUNDRY PRODU $40.50 $486.00 17.95 215.4 $14.95 $179.40
N242406CRE   450 1M LINER CLEAR 24X24  CS             7-10 GALLON LINER HI-D $35.10 $15,795.00 21.05 9472.5 9.8 4410 14.1 6345 $10.15 $4,567.50
N404812CRE     1172 250 LINER CLEAR 40X48  CS             40-45 GALLON ON A LINER HI-D $60.75 $71,199.00 47.4 55552.8 16.2 18986.4 21.09 24717.48 $19.71 $23,100.12
S4715B         4 100 LINER BLACK 43X47  CS             56 GALLON LINER X-HEAVY $58.05 $232.20 38.34 153.36 19.1 76.4 23.22 92.88 $16.10 $64.40
36334-04       12 12/16X16 YELLOW MIC  PK             MICROFIBER $21.60 $259.20 9.63 115.56 10.68 128.16 $9.10 $109.20
36334-05       12 12/16X16 RED MICROF  PK             MICROFIBER $21.60 $259.20 15.78 189.36 10.68 128.16 $9.10 $109.20
36334-14       12 12/16X16 BLUE MICRO  PK             MICROFIBER $21.60 $259.20 9.63 115.56 10.68 128.16 $9.10 $109.20
2263Y          12 EA/MOP BUCKET 26 QT EA             MOP BUCKET/WR $63.45 $761.40 68.28 819.36 37.98 455.76 $28.10 $337.20
3353YW         5 EA/MOP BUCKET 35 QT EA             MOP BUCKET/WR $90.45 $452.25 86.42 432.1 39.98 199.9 $36.05 $180.25
36904          15 EA/COMBO 35 QT SIDE  EA             35 QT. MOPBUCKET/  MOP BUCKET/WR $40.50 $607.50 57.7 865.5 39.75 596.25 $42.10 $631.50
36909          40 EA/WET FLOOR SIGN ENEA             MOP BUCKET/WR $31.05 $1,242.00 10.64 425.2 4.99 199.6 $10.25 $410.00
SW12YW         10 EA/WRINGER SIDE PRES  EA             MOP BUCKET/WR $78.30 $783.00 106.72 1067.2 39.99 399.9 $30.05 $300.50
36937500       30 EA/HANDLE 60" FIBERG  EA             BLUE W/PLASTIC EN   MOP HANDLES $17.55 $526.50 NO BID `NO BID 7.79 233.7 $7.88 $236.40
36959500       80 EA/HANDLE 60" METAL  EA             K-RELEASE MOP 1" DMOP HANDLES $13.50 $1,080.00 15.87 1269.6 6.25 500 $8.91 $712.80
3200           12 EA/MOPHEAD SMALL L  EA             BAND COTTON BLENMOP WET $13.50 $162.00 7.7 92.4 3.45 41.4 $1.99 $23.88
3241           12 EA/MOPHEAD MEDIUM  EA             GREEN BAND COTTO  MOP WET $13.50 $162.00 9.13 109.56 3.98 47.76 $3.50 $42.00
369066         80 EA/MOPHEAD #16 4 PL   EA             TE CUT END MOP WET $4.73 $378.00 7.09 87.09 2.89 231.2 $2.15 $172.00
369070         40 EA/MOPHEAD #20 4 PL   EA             TE CUT END MOP WET $6.75 $270.00 6.67 266.8 3.49 139.6 $2.55 $102.00
369074         12 EA/MOPHEAD #24 4 PL   EA             TE CUT END MOP WET $6.75 $81.00 9.85 118.2 4.69 56.28 $3.20 $38.40
369820         107 EA/MOPHEAD WET 20  EA             WHITE CUT END MOP WET $8.10 $866.70 4.05 433.35 2.59 277.13 $2.52 $269.64
369824         12 EA/MOPHEAD WET 24  EA             WHITE CUT END MOP WET $9.45 $113.40 5.28 63.36 2.89 34.68 $2.95 $35.40
369832         12 EA/MOPHEAD WET 32  EA             WHITE CUT END MOP WET $10.80 $129.60 6.72 80.64 3.59 43.08 $3.75 $45.40
40301          24 EA/MOP 12" SPONGE R  EA             DLE 51" MOP WET $18.90 $453.60 38.39 921.36 $11.76 $282.24
8114G          15 EA-14QT PAIL W/POUR EA             GREY PAILS $12.15 $182.25 20.27 304.05 5.39 80.85 $6.61 $99.15
111720         12 2.5M/COPY PAPER 11X  CS             LEDGER 92 BRIGHT SPAPER COPY $116.10 $1,393.20 62.5 750 $34.95 $419.40
5136           12 12/20 OZ FURNITURE PCS             LEMON SCENT POLISH FURN $81.00 $972.00 62.48 749.76 36.98 443.76 $32.60 $391.20
5197           12 12/20 OZ STAINLESS ST CS             CLEANER OIL BASE POLISH METAL $90.45 $1,085.40 35.69 428.28 34.98 419.76 $31.05 $372.60
76523          12 8/POLISH BRASSO 8OZ CS             POLISH METAL $27.00 $324.00 23.35 280.2 $21.68 $260.16
1619COTT       12 12/TOWEL TERI 16X19 DZ             100% COTTON WHITRAGS CLOTH $68.85 $826.20 66.61 799.32 $4.99 $59.76



361203600      15 EA/SQUEEGE 36" BLACK EA             W/STEEL FRAME FLO  SQUEEGE FLOOR $31.05 $465.75 37.83 567.45 14.99 224.85 $23.01 $345.15
36631800       7 EA/SQUEEGE 18" FOAM  EA             K DUAL EDGE / TAPE  SQUEEGE FLOOR $21.60 $151.20 28.69 200.83 6.99 48.93 $12.95 $90.65
281H           25 EA/HANDLE SQUEEGE FEA             SQUEEGEE SQUEEGE WINDO $33.75 $843.75 4.07 40.7 2.99 74.75 $2.38 $59.50
36283H00       10 EA/ METAL SQUEEGEE EA             SQUEEGE WINDO $33.75 $337.50 21.57 215.7 $2.38 $23.80
50RA           35 5M/TOILET SEAT COVE  CS             TOILET MISC $64.80 $2,268.00 31.3 31.3 39.98 1399.3 $32.46 $1,136.10
36438600       35 EA/PLUNGERS TOILET #EA             INDUSTRIAL TOILET PROD $13.50 $472.50 4.51 157.85 6.98 244.3 $3.57 $124.95
4010           6300 24/TANDEM 3.9"X4" 2P  CS             HIGH CAPACITY SMA   TOILET TISS CONT $86.40 $544,320.00 42.61 268443 $46.89 $232,570.40
JRT002         12 12/TISSUE 9" 2 PLY JR J CS             TOILET TISS JUNR $40.50 $486.00 25.19 302.28 $17.99 $215.88
1358           7000 6/TANDEM 7.5"X775' M  CS             ROLL TOWEL BROWNTOWEL CONTROL $68.85 $481,950.00 29.1 203700 $42.61 $231,159.25
101751         12 4M/TOWEL M-FOLD KRCS             DISCO NPMFN4000 TOWEL M-FOLD $21.60 $259.20 22.5 270 $12.95 $155.40
101750         10 4M/TOWEL S-FOLD KRACS             DISCO NP12334K TOWEL S-FOLD $27.00 $270.00 23.13 231.3 $15.50 $155.00
1358B          10 WASTEBSKT13QTBEIGE  EA             TRASH CONTAINE $6.75 $67.50 NO BID NO BID 3.99 39.9 $3.23 $32.30
1702BE         20 BEIGE LID FOR 25BE TR  EA             TRASH CONTAINE $24.30 $486.00 SEE BELOW SOLD COMPLETE 18.99 379.8 $21.84 $436.80
25BE           20 BEIGE 25 GAL. TRASH C EA             TRASH CONTAINE $62.14 $1,242.81 276.09 5521.8 39.98 799.6 $29.31 $586.20
2818BE         30 EA/28QT BEIGE WASTE EA             TRASH CONTAINE $8.10 $243.00 NO BID NO BID 3.79 113.7 $3.33 $99.90
2818BR         50 EA/WASTEBSKT 28QT BEA             TRASH CONTAINE $6.75 $337.50 NO BID NO BID 3.79 189.5 $3.33 $166.50
3255           47 EA/DOLLY FOR 20-55 COEA             FITS 20-55GAL HUSK  TRASH CONTAINE $76.95 $3,616.65 95.68 4496.96 20.98 986.06 $19.44 $913.68
34104423       10 EA/44GAL GRAY TRASH EA             TRASH CONTAINE $35.10 $351.00 69.47 694.7 55.98 559.8 $29.23 $292.30
3691103        12 EA/DOLLY FOR 20-55 COEA             FITS 20-55GAL HUSK  TRASH CONTAINE $76.95 $923.40 95.68 1148.16 20.98 251.76 $19.44 $233.28
3894           200 5/80WIPER 9.75X16.75 CS             WIPER POP UP BOX WIPERS $47.25 $9,450.00 76.84 15368 $53.51 $10,702.00
41041          12 160/WYPALL 12.5X16.8  CS             WIPER POP UP BOX WIPERS $28.35 $340.20 28.43 341.16 $40.67 $488.04
782040         100 6/40 GRAFFITI / VANDA  CS             7"X11" WIPER ODORWIPERS $189.00 $18,900.00 74.26 7426 55.98 5598 $52.05 $5,205.00
F3154CAN12     12 6/120 WIPE HANDYCLE  CS             FOOD SURFACE SAFE WIPERS $97.20 $1,166.40 46.93 563.16 $36.89 $442.68

TOTAL TOTAL: $1,641,413.16 TOTAL: $863,163.69 TOTAL: $23,472.80 TOTAL: $47,991.88 TOTAL: $31,155.36 TOTAL: $719,317.28

Unit Price

PR470 new ite 24/ Transcend 2ply 141  CS             HIGH CAPACITY SMA  TOILET TISSUE
813NP new ite Transcend Paper towel  CS             ROLL TOWEL BROWNPAPER TOWEL

NO BID 

          o additional charge IAW SPECIFIC REQUIREMENTS, item 10 located on page 5 of the IFB*
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